

<u>LOT #</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>MINIMUM BID</u>	<u>AMOUNT BID</u>
1	One (1) Sears refrigerator Model 25376833400	NO MINIMUM	\$ 107.00
2	Two (2) metal cabinet units with glass doors; three (3) metal cabinet units	\$ 60.00	\$ 240.00
3	Four (4) metal shelving units; three (3) wood shelving units	\$ 60.00	\$ 201.00
4	One (1) removable utility rack for van	NO MINIMUM	\$ 3.88
5	19 tables/desks	NO MINIMUM	\$ 20.00
6	11 tables/desks	NO MINIMUM	\$ 5.11
7	Three (3) round tables	NO MINIMUM	\$ 45.00
8	Nine (9) rolls foam matting	NO MINIMUM	\$ 556.00
9	Eight (8) wood cabinet units	NO MINIMUM	\$ 58.00
10	Seven (7) shelving units; one (1) cart; two (2) small desks	NO MINIMUM	\$ 85.00
11	Two (2) rolling computer desks	NO MINIMUM	\$ 36.98
12	Four (4) server racks	\$ 60.00	\$ 86.00
13	Three (3) Dell server racks	\$ 60.00	\$ 113.72
14	Four (4) Sun server racks with one (1) SUN Microsystem V880 UA#234706	\$ 60.00	\$ 90.00

15	One (1) desk ; five (5) desktop podiums	NO MINIMUM	\$ 35.00
16	Two (2) wood tables	NO MINIMUM	\$ 59.00
17	Two (2) glass top tables; one (1) wood table	NO MINIMUM	\$ 50.00
18	Approximately 25 aluminum windows 34"x59"	\$ 750.00	NO BID
19	One (1) Federal food case merchandiser	NO MINIMUM	\$ 40.00
20	Approximately 50 wood chairs	NO MINIMUM	\$ 106.98
21	Approximately 48 wood chairs	NO MINIMUM	\$ 118.98
22	One (1) white wingback chair; one (1) red sofa	NO MINIMUM	\$ 34.88
23	One (1) black metal office desk	NO MINIMUM	\$ 12.88
24	Two (2) folding tables	NO MINIMUM	\$ 17.52
25	Approximately 50 wood chairs	NO MINIMUM	\$ 105.00
26	Six (6) chairs	NO MINIMUM	\$ 52.00
27	One (1) Delfield cooler Model 406	NO MINIMUM	\$ 101.50
28	One (1) Freedom bath tub unit Model AF12114	NO MINIMUM	\$ 251.50
29	One (1) sofa	NO MINIMUM	\$ 50.00

30	Approximately 61 cartons library periodicals	NO MINIMUM	\$ 26.11
31	Assorted window blinds	NO MINIMUM	\$ 27.00
32	Quinton Treadmill Club Track Hyper Drive s/n 00377-001-62513 UA# 224854	\$ 100.00	\$ 207.00
33	Approximately 30 chairs	NO MINIMUM	\$ 63.00
34	Approximately 20 office chairs	NO MINIMUM	\$ 45.00
35	Assorted office equipment including: fax machines; typewriters, print cartridges; file trays; calculators; file folders; microfiche	NO MINIMUM	\$ 146.00
36	One (1) desk unit with hutch	NO MINIMUM	\$ 5.00 FCFS
37	Assorted wood picture frames	NO MINIMUM	\$ 45.00
38	Assorted audio visual equipment including: TV's; VCR's; carts; projection screens; speakers	NO MINIMUM	\$ 105.00
39	One (1) gallon paint shaker; one (1) Binks 41-4316 Comet 3 sprayer	NO MINIMUM	\$ 75.00
40	One (1) Venturo Lift Model ET6KR UA# 232151	\$ 75.00	\$ 351.50
41	Approximately 85 boxes of library books	NO MINIMUM	\$ 255.00
42	One (1) glass airbrush mural-Coach Paul "Bear" Bryant	NO MINIMUM	WITHDRAWN
43	Audio visual equipment including: five (5) projectors UA# 228417; 11 speakers; two (2) VHS players; two (2) stereos; one (1) record player	NO MINIMUM	\$ 158.98

44	Two (2) a/v carts with six (6) monitors	NO MINIMUM	\$ 22.50
45	Four (4) live animal traps; one (1) electrical box; four (4) cordless drills	\$ 75.00	\$ 77.77
46	Assorted microscopes	NO MINIMUM	\$ 153.00
47	One (1) HP LaserJet 9000DN printer; one (1) Xerox Phaser 6250 printer	NO MINIMUM	\$ 46.00
48	Five (5) Sanyo video cassette recorders Model VWM-950	NO MINIMUM	\$ 51.96
49	One (1) red sofa	NO MINIMUM	\$ 21.00
50	10 wood doors	NO MINIMUM	\$ 52.00
51	Assorted video monitors; one (1) Ampex video recorder UA#204607; two (2) JVC DY-90W camcorders UA#'s 229800, 230919	NO MINIMUM	\$ 450.95
52	Assorted auto headsets	NO MINIMUM	\$ 77.50
53	Assorted plants/tree décor	NO MINIMUM	\$ 12.00
54	Assorted display shelving/magazine shelving and signs	NO MINIMUM	\$ 18.00
55	Four (4) gray computer desks	NO MINIMUM	\$ 51.50
56	Six (6) gray computer desks	NO MINIMUM	\$ 50.50
57	One (1) reception desk	NO MINIMUM	\$ 10.00
58	One (1) reception desk	NO MINIMUM	\$ 20.00

59	Four (4) wood easels; two (2) 36"x80" bifold doors	\$ 50.00	\$ 55.52
60	Four (4) gray computer desks	NO MINIMUM	\$ 51.50
61	Two (2) damaged under ground blowers; two (2) damaged Motorola radios	NO MINIMUM	\$ 11.33
62	One (1) Briggs/Stratton 3 HP engine	\$ 75.00	NO BID
63	Two (2) file cabinets	\$ 40.00	\$ 45.01
64	Three (3) Dell server racks	\$ 60.00	\$ 529.00
65	16 UA track hurdles	\$ 128.00	\$ 151.00
66	103 UA track hurdles	\$ 2,575.00	NO BID
67	Three (3) stripe marking machines	NO MINIMUM	\$ 38.88
68	Assorted track equipment	NO MINIMUM	\$ 78.00
69	One (1) wood bench	NO MINIMUM	\$ 113.98
70	One (1) wood desk	NO MINIMUM	\$ 5.00 FCFS
71	Assorted stainless soap dispensers and towel dispensers	NO MINIMUM	\$ 15.59
72	One (1) Pincor 11 HP generator Model PR-55HM5	NO MINIMUM	\$ 151.00
73	One (1) metal base cabinet unit	NO MINIMUM	\$ 101.00

74	One (1) chair	NO MINIMUM	\$ 21.00
75	One (1) exam table; one (1) massage chair	NO MINIMUM	\$ 50.00
76	One (1) Pioneer-Merits mobility cart	NO MINIMUM	\$ 101.50
77	One (1) Altra carpet machine Model 400SP CFR UA# 230651; one (1) Pony carpet scrubber/extractor Model 20 SCA UA# 221268	NO MINIMUM	\$ 52.00
78	One (1) concrete slab saw with Wisconsin engine	\$ 300.00	NO BID
79	One (1) paint sprayer-Graco Model M73490	\$ 50.00	\$ 79.99
80	Two (2) gray computer desks	NO MINIMUM	\$ 5.00 FCFS
81	Approximately 22 office chairs	NO MINIMUM	\$ 81.08
82	Approximately 42 wood chairs	NO MINIMUM	\$ 106.98
83	Approximately 40 wood chairs	NO MINIMUM	\$ 63.98
84	Approximately 44 wood chairs; eight (8) boxes of wire bookends	NO MINIMUM	\$ 53.98
85	Approximately 45 wood chairs; eight (8) boxes of wire bookends	NO MINIMUM	\$ 53.98
86	Tote bags-Parent Program with "A" logo	NO MINIMUM	\$ 101.50
87	Tote bags-Parent Program with "A" logo	NO MINIMUM	\$ 101.50
88	Tote bags-Parent Program with "A" logo	NO MINIMUM	\$ 101.50

89	Tote bags-Parent Program with "A" logo	NO MINIMUM	\$ 101.50
90	Assorted lamp shades	NO MINIMUM	\$ 20.00
91	SciTech Signature machine Model 800 UA#234954	NO MINIMUM	\$ 40.00
92	Assorted library equipment including: eight (8) gray computer desks; stools; office chairs; wood shelving; typewriters; TV's, three (3) large table tops	NO MINIMUM	\$ 125.00
93	Assorted library equipment including: wood cubicles; typewriter, file cabinets; computer tables; projection screen	NO MINIMUM	\$ 47.00
94	Approximately 195 pairs of Nike football cleats-Zoom Merciless TD 354905-sizes 10 (6) pairs; 10.5 (6) pairs; 11 (4) pairs; 11.5 (6) pairs; 12 (23) pairs; 12.5 (29) pairs; 13 (47) pairs; 13.5 (42) pairs; 14 (16) pairs; 18 (3) pairs; 19 (7) pairs	\$ 3,900.00	NO BID
95	Approximately 30 pairs of Nike Zoom Nubby Wide 352640-sizes 15 (6) pairs; 16 (6) pairs; 17 (6) pairs; 18 (6) pairs; 19 (6) pairs	\$ 600.00	NO BID
96	Approximately 30 pairs Nike Pro Shark Wide 352638-sizes 13.5 (6) pairs; 14 (6) pairs; 14.5 (6) pairs; 15 (6) pairs; 16 (6) pairs	\$ 600.00	NO BID
97	Approximately 211 pairs Nike football cleats-Flyposite TD 355952-sizes 11 (12) pairs; 11.5 (6) pairs; 12 (24) pairs; 12.5 (26) pairs; 13 (23) pairs; 13.5 (26) pairs; 14 (22) pairs; 15 (27) pairs; 16 (19) pairs; Flyposite D 354781-006-sizes 14 (1) pair;16 (8) pair; Zoom Vapor Fly D 396255-001 sizes 14 (6) pairs; Zoom Flyposite 354781-0011-size 12 (11) pairs	\$ 4,220.00	NO BID

98	Approximately 734 pairs of Nike football gloves-styles PGF-146 Magna Grip Vapor College-size XXL (43) pairs; PGF093 Z Tack-size XL (2) pairs; PGF 138 College Magna Grip Speed Tack-sizes XXL (5) pairs; XXXL (91) pairs; PGF-147 Speed Tack V College-sizes L (4) pairs; XXL (9) pairs; XXXXL (1) pair; PGF-119 College Magna Grip Blade II-sizes L (30) pairs; XL (21) pairs; PGF-105 Magna Grip Speed Tack IV-sizes M (11) pairs; L (43) pairs; XXXL (29) pairs; PGF-103 Speed Tack IV-sizes M (29) pairs; L (109) pairs; XL (184) pairs; XXL (13) pairs; PGF-077 NCAA Magna Grip II-sizes M (2) pairs; L (14) pairs; PGF-102-size L (6) pairs; PGF-120 Magna Grip Super Bad-sizes M (3) pairs; PGF-078 Speed Tack III-sizes M (16) pairs; L (35) pairs; PGF-099 Force Palm-sizes XXL (5) pair; XXXL (5) five pairs; PGF-050 Speed Tack II-size XXL (26) pair; PGF-043-size L (1) pair	\$ 3,670.00	NO BID
99	Two (2) high jump pits w/ standards; One (1) pole vault pit w/ standards	\$ 4,100.00	\$ 5,500.00
100	One (1) 1999 Ford Taurus 4-door sedan VIN# 1FAFP53U5XA262690 UA# 228787 S1891B	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 2,851.00