
SALES OF SURPLUS

LOT #

THE UNIVERSITY OF ALABAMA

QUOTATION SHEET

ALL QUANTITIES ARE ESTIMATED

DESCRIPTION

PS2008-32

   MINIMUM BID     AMOUNT BID

1 Approximately 135 chairs, various styles and colors.  1 metal
chaise, 2 benches, and 2 love seats. No Minimum $88.88

2 Approximately 14 file cabinets, various sizes and colors. No Minimum $16.88

3 Approximately 1 sofa, 2 chairs, 1 coffee table, 2 lamps, 1 mirror and No Minimum $26.00

5 pictures.

4 Approximately 1 sofa, 2 chairs, 2 book shelves, 3 lamps, 1 lamp No Minimum $27.88

table, 1 screen and 8 pictures.

5 Approximately 15 tables, various sizes, 1 credenza, and 1 mail No Minimum $6.88

distribution bin.

6 Approximately 8 tables, 1 lectern, and 2 storage units. No Minimum $6.88

7 Audio Visual Equipment including:  Approximately 6 color display No Minimum $148.88

monitors, overhead, projectors, televisions, audio console sound

board UA#218592, video conferencing system, V-TelEnterprise Series,

projector screen, Zenith projector UA#225896, Sharp VCR UA#204711,

Panasonic VCR UA#202803, Bell & Howell projector, Kodak

Ektagraphic slide projector, and approximately 17 slide projector trays.

8 Approximately 4 copiers:  1 Toshiba 2060 UA#227740, 1 HP Laserjet No Minimum No Bid

8150N SN: JPDLR57121, 1 HP Laserjet 8000N UA#228043, and

1 Ricoh Aficio 401 UA#228667.

9 Office Equipment including:  Shredders, typewriters, calculators, file No Minimum $6.88

boxes, binders, chalk board, and fax machines.

10 House ware items including: microwaves, dishes, glassware, heaters, No Minimum $55.55

fan, and humidifier.

11 Various styles and size tables, desk, and bookcases. No Minimum $27.50
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$6.88

12 Various size tables and approximately 4 desk lamps. No Minimum

13 Approximately 9 rolling carts of various size and styles. No Minimum $16.88

14 Approximately 30 athletic shoulder pads. $1,500.00 No Bid

15 Approximately 34 chairs, various styles and colors, and 3 sofas. No Minimum $38.88

16 Approximately 87 black Nike jerseys with numbers and approximately $896.00 No Bid

41 black Nike jerseys without numbers.

17 Approximately 5 computer desks, 1 cabinet, and 1 desk. No Minimum No Bid

18 One Mack garbage truck, white MN:  MR6855, $2,848.00 $3,500.00

VIN:  1M2K127ASEM007554

state tag #S5990A, UA#196135 and one Heil loader/packer front end

MN:  612-2903 SN:  DCE2701131 UA#228744 

19 Approximately 37 pair of football pants, various sizes from 26 to 46. $550.00 No Bid

20 Approximately 11 Nike Blade II TD Low Cleats (2 size 11, 7 size 12 and $165.00 No Bid

2 size 15).


