
SALES OF SURPLUS

LOT #

THE UNIVERSITY OF ALABAMA

QUOTATION SHEET

ALL QUANTITIES ARE ESTIMATED

DESCRIPTION

PS2008-34

   MINIMUM BID     AMOUNT BID

1 One (1) new trailer jack 200.00$         225.00$         

2 One commercial size freezer No Minimum 103.97$         

3 Audio Video Equipment including: Calcomp Digitizer UA#100224114; No Minimum 210.00$         

Ampex Beta Cam VCR UA#208714; Sharp Projector UA#225575;

Phillips Recorder UA#215774; overhead projectors, Panasonic, Emerson

and Sony VCR; camera's various styles and brands; televisions; monitors;

AV carts; three (3) projection screens (Banner Up); audio display case;

and an Eyecom 3000 Fiche Reader.

4 Two (2) rugs No Minimum No Bid

5 Four (4) loveseats; two (2) chairs, and one (1) sofa No Minimum 20.00$           

6 Three (3) van seats No Minimum No Bid

7 Office Equipment including: typewriters; fax machines; calculators; No Minimum 132.00$         

a smart board; and a HP DesignJet 755CM Printer UA#100226343

8 One (1) Delfield Cooler salad/sandwich MN:D4032N SN:339660-T; No Minimum 79.00$           

one (1) Delfield Cooler salad/sandwich MN:4248-12 SN:340664-T;

one (1) Lancer Ice Cooled Drop In Drink Dispenser MN:2206

SN:852186-0605MOAIZ; one (1) warmer Item #120036; one (1) Low

Temperature Sandwich Warmer Chick-Fil-A MN:HL2Z2AIL2B;
one (1) plastic CO2 tank cart

9 One (1) 1994 Honda Civic VIN#1HGEG8642RL047134 S5923A 150.00$         No Bid

10 One (1) 303A Niton XRS Lead Based Analyzer UA#231642 8,000.00$      No Bid

 BY APPOINTMENT ONLY

 Safe State Environmental Programs   Beth Gaines 205-348-8564

MUST SHOW RADIOACTIVE MATERIAL LICENSE

11 Six (6) boxes of phones and accessories No Minimum 620.00$         
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12 Lawn & Garden Equipment including: one (1) commercial lawn mower 77.00$           

Honda MN:HRC215KSXA SN:MZAU 6147974; one (1) Heavy Duty Chain

Drive Tiller 5HP Maxim; one (1) Heavy Duty Chain Drive Tiller 5HP Maxim

13 Approximately 90 chairs - various styles and colors No Minimum 21.88$           

14 Exercise Equipment including: one (1) Stair Master PT step machine No Minimum $42.88

UA#221952; three (3) Life Fitness stationary bikes UA#212892, 226821,

212895; one (1) scale; one (1) mat; one (1) Ping-Pong table.

15 Approximately 27 TV's various sizes and brands (non-working) No Minimum No Bid

16 Wooden furniture including: three (3) large bookcases; five (5) computer No Minimum 101.00$         

desks, one (1) credenza; one (1) chalk board; and various other pieces.

17 Two (2) each Bridgeport Milling Machines Model Apollo SN:AP109 and 2,500.00$      6,257.00$      

Model Apollo SN:AP111

Department of Physics and Astronomy BY APPOINTMENT ONLY 

Contact Danny Whitcomb 205-348-4591

View in place Room 121 Gallalee Hall

Viewing times 8:00AM-11:30AM and 1:00PM-4:00PM each day

18 One (1) Hardinge, Horizontal Milling Machine 26"X6 1/2" table 100.00$         252.52$         

460V 3Phase

Department of Physics and Astronomy BY APPOINTMENT ONLY

Contact Danny Whitcomb 205-348-4591

View in place Room 121 Gallalee Hall

Viewing times 8:00AM-11:30AM and 1:00PM-4:00PM each day

19 One (1) O'Neal-Irwin Mfg. Co. #4 Brake SN:4064 10.00$           121.52$         

Department of Physics and Astronomy BY APPOINTMENT ONLY

Contact Danny Whitcomb 205-348-4591

View in place Room 121 Gallalee Hall

Viewing times 8:00AM-11:30AM and 1:00PM-4:00PM each day
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20 One (1) G/S Hevi-Duty Electric Transformer Cat#T2H-5 SN:LW731-4 50.00$           200.00$         

Department of Physics and Astronomy BY APPOINTMENT ONLY

Contact Danny Whitcomb 205-348-4591

View in place Room 121 Gallalee Hall

Viewing times 8:00AM-11:30AM and 1:00PM-4:00PM each day

21 One (1) Darex, Drill Sharpener SN:517673 25.00$           150.00$         

Department of Physics and Astronomy BY APPOINTMENT ONLY

Contact Danny Whitcomb 205-348-4591

View in place Room 121 Gallalee Hall

Viewing times 8:00AM-11:30AM and 1:00PM-4:00PM each day

22 One (1) Grinder 12", 3Phase SN:736889 25.00$           100.00$         

Department of Physics and Astronomy BY APPOINTMENT ONLY

Contact Danny Whitcomb 205-348-4591

View in place Room 121 Gallalee Hall

Viewing times 8:00AM-11:30AM and 1:00PM-4:00PM each day


