SALES OF SURPLUS

THE UNIVERSITY OF ALABAMA

QUOTATION SHEET
ALL QUANTITIES ARE ESTIMATED

PS2009-10

LOT # DESCRIPTION MINIMUM BID AMOUNT BID
1 A/V Equipment UA#'s 231894, 231895, 231893, 100229852, 200229852, No Minimum $176.00
100205433, 208621, 212478, 215390, 204156, 203874, 173159
2 A/V Equipment No Minimum $156.00
3 AV Equipment No Minimum $202.00
4 AV Equipment No Minimum $512.00
5 Approximately 11 tables No Minimum $110.00
6 Approximately 42 chairs No Minimum $40.00
7 Approximately 30 boxes of telephones and accessories No Minimum $125.85
8 Office equipment-including a Mita DC-1560 copier, typewriters, fax No Minimum $58.00
machines, shredders, etc.
9 Approximately 18 blue stack chairs No Minimum $57.00
10 One (1) NuArc FT32V2UP Ultra, plus flip-top plate maker No Minimum $5.00
FCFS
11 Three (3) dental chairs and accessories No Minimum $5.00
FCFS
12 Approximately 10 chairs No Minimum $30.00
13 One (1) pallet speaker-single large $1,000.00 NO BID
14 One (1) pallet speaker-single large $1,000.00 NO BID
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15 One (1) pallet speaker-single large $1,000.00 NO BID
16 One (1) pallet speaker-single large $1,000.00 NO BID
17 One (1) pallet speaker-single large $1,000.00 NO BID
18 One (1) pallet speaker-single large $1,000.00 NO BID
19 One (1) pallet speakers-two (2) small speakers $1,000.00 NO BID
20 One (1) pallet speakers-two (2) small speakers $1,000.00 NO BID
21 One (1) pallet speakers-two (2) small speakers $1,000.00 NO BID
22 One (1) pallet speakers-two (2) small speakers $1,000.00 NO BID
23 One (1) pallet speakers-two (2) small speakers $1,000.00 NO BID
24 One (1) pallet speakers-two (2) small speakers $1,000.00 NO BID
25 One (1) pallet speakers-two (2) small speakers $1,000.00 NO BID
26 One (1) pallet speakers-two (2) small speakers $1,000.00 NO BID
27 One (1) pallet speakers-two (2) small speakers $1,000.00 NO BID

28 One (1) pallet speakers-two (2) small speakers $1,000.00 NO BID
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29 Wood furniture-includes desks, cabinets, study carrels, etc. No Minimum $56.56
30 Two (2) wooden shipping crates No Minimum $10.00
31 Approximately 10 tables No Minimum $101.00
32 Approximately 15 small desks No Minimum $6.56
33 Approximately 4 bookshelves No Minimum $152.10




